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Item 1.01  Entry into a Material Definitive Agreement.

          Under the Oil-Dri Corporation of America Annual Incentive Plan (the “Plan”), eligible employees (including the Company’s executive officers) may
receive annual cash bonuses equal to a percentage of salary. Target bonuses range from five percent to fifty percent of base salary, with the specific percentage
being determined by each eligible employee’s salary grade.  Essentially all salaried employees of the Company and its domestic and Canadian subsidiaries are
eligible to participate in the Plan; for the fiscal year ended July 31, 2005, there were approximately 260 eligible employees.

          Each fiscal year the Company sets corporate earnings targets, or other performance measures, to be met in order for a bonus to be paid under the Plan for
that fiscal year.  At the regular meeting of the Compensation Committee of the Board of Directors on October 10, 2005, the Compensation Committee approved
management’s proposal to set the performance measure for the fiscal year ending July 31, 2006 to be the increase (or decrease) in earnings per fully diluted share
in fiscal 2006 as compared with the fiscal 2005 earnings per fully diluted share.

          The performance measures for fiscal 2006 provide that employees exempt from the overtime requirements of the Fair Labor Standards Act will receive
their full target bonus if earnings per share exceed the prior year’s earnings per share by ten percent (10%).  If earnings per share exceed the prior year’s by
twenty percent (20%), a bonus payment of 150% of target will be made and if earnings exceed the prior year’s by thirty percent (30%), a bonus payment of  200%
of target will be made.  Under the Plan bonuses are capped at 200% of target bonus.  If earnings per share for fiscal 2006 are equal to fiscal 2005 earnings per
share, a bonus payment of 75% of target will be made.  If earnings per share are less than the prior year’s by not more than ten percent (10%), a bonus payment of
50% of target will be made and if earnings are less than the prior year’s by not more than twenty percent (20%), a bonus payment of  25% of target will be made. 
If earnings per share are less than the prior year’s by more than twenty percent (20%) because of extenuating circumstances or one-time events, the Company’s
Chief Executive Officer was granted discretion to pay up to 25% of target bonus.

          Employees not exempt from the overtime requirements of the Fair Labor Standards Act will receive their full target bonus of 7.5% of pay if fiscal 2006
earnings per share are equal to or greater than fiscal 2005 earnings per share.  Bonuses for these employees are capped at 100% of target.  If earnings per share are
less than the prior year’s by not more than twenty percent (20%), a bonus payment of 50% of target will be made to these employees.  For all participating
employees, if the increase (or decrease) in earnings per share falls between two of the specified percentages, the bonus payment percentage will be prorated. 

          Additionally the Chief Executive Officer was granted discretion to adjust, up or down, bonus payments to individual employees by 25 points (for example
if exempt employees were to receive 50% of target bonus, the Chief Executive Officer could adjust an individual employee’s payment to be as little as 25% of
target bonus or as much as 75% of target bonus).  This discretion is to be used only for exceptionally good or exceptionally poor performance and all such
adjustments must net to zero and will have no impact on the total bonus dollars distributed under the Plan.
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SIGNATURES

          Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the Registrant has duly caused this report to be signed on its behalf by the
undersigned hereunto duly authorized.

 OIL-DRI CORPORATION OF AMERICA
   
   
 By: /s/ Charles P. Brissman
  
  Charles P. Brissman
  Vice President and General Counsel
   
Date: October 14, 2005   
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